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Athletic Equipment Bid 1/28/2014

ANALYSIS SHEET FOR COMPARISON PURPOSES ONLY

PRINTED TEE SHIRTS, 
Athletic Equip, Opened 
3/6/15, 11 am

Softball 
Sliders

Softball 
visors

Softball 
Helmets

Softballs(y
ellow)

Safety 
balls

Softball 
Bags

Basketball 
bags

Hooded 
Sweatshirts

Basketball
s 

Indoor/Out
door 

Street 
Shot

Basketball
s Varsity 

Game 
BallBasketb

alls
Early pay 
discount

Cool Air Creations, Inc, 10 
Business Park Drive, 
Smithfield, RI 02917 n/a 5.70ea n/a n/a n/a 25.00ea 25.00ea 14.53ea n/a n/a n/a n/a

BSN Sports Inc, 715 
Twining Rd, Dresher PA 
19025 no bid 8.00 ea 33.08 ea

71.77-1 
doz

55.20-1 
doz no bid no bid no bid 19.37 ea 5.59 ea 46.65 ea N/A

Pyramid School Products, 
6510 North 54th street, 
Tampa FL 33610-1908 no bid 6.99 ea no bid

50.00-1 
doz

43.08-1 
doz no bid no bid no bid

13.09-1 
doz

6.99-1 
doz 42.49-ea N/A

S&S Worldwide, 75 Mill 
Street, Colchester, CT 
06415 no bid no bid no bid no bid

55.56-1 
doz no bid no bid no bid 14.08 ea no bid 47.50 ea N/A

Hat World, Inc, DBA 
Anaconda Sports, 85 
Katrine Lane, NY 12449

1842.00-
1 doz 6.75

419.4-1 
doz

34.2-1 
doz 55.2-1 doz no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 44.95 ea

Elmwood Sports Center, 
Inc
1553 Elmwood Ave, 
Cranston, RI 02910 18.94 ea 6.49 ea 38.94 ea

49.94- 1 
doz

57.94-1 
doz 29.94 29.94 21.94 ea 17.95 ea 7.95 ea 45.00 ea
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