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Chemical Fertilizers 2014

1. LescoFlo 25 
gallons

2. Rubigan A.S. 
8 gallons 3. Bayleton 50 

4. Daconil 
Weather 

/Manicure 
Flow 22 

cases

5. Subdue 
Maxx 13 

cases
6. Chipco GT 22 

cases

7. Aliette or 
Prodigy D.G. 

15 cases

8.Flowable 
Mancozeb 

DO NOT 
NEED AT 

THIS TIME
9. Emerald 3 

case

10. Merit 
0.2 0-0-7 

fertilizer 75 
bags

11. Fertilizer 
26-3-13 275 

bags

12. Fertilizer 
18-5-9 

w/dimension; 
100 bags

13. Fertilizer 
18-0-18; 

100 bags

14.Fertilizer 
15-3-8;  
NONE 

NEEDED 
THIS YEAR

15. Top 
Dressing; 

30 tons
VENDOR

EH Turf Supply, Inc., DBA 
Allens Seed, 693 South 
County Trail, Exeter RI 

02822
331.25 CASE 

X5=1656.25 (3) NO BID NO BID

160.00 CASE 
X22= 3520 

(4)
834.00 X13 

10842.00 (5)
216.00 CASE 

X22=4752.00 (6)

355.00 CASE 
X15 = 

5325.00 (7) NONE

1450.40 
CASE X3 = 

4351.20 

17.64/BAG 
X 75= 

1323.00 No Bid No Bid
50.00/BAG 
X100=5000 NONE No Bid

John Deere Landscapes, 
1385 E. 36th Street, 

Cleveland OH 44114 $235.42 NO BID $3,000.00 $150.00 743.56 (37) 209 (38) 329 (39) NONE $1,450.40 $13.25 No Bid $15.95 50 (40) NONE No Bid

Valley Green Inc., 23 
Appian Way, Smithfield, 

RI 02917 $210/case  (15) $319.00 $3,000.00 126 (16) 699 (17) 189 (18) 355 (19) NONE $1,390.00 $14.90 36 (20) 16 (21) $45.00 NONE No Bid

Helena Chemical 
Company, 101 Elm Street, 

Hatfield MA 01038 175.00 (23) NO BID $525.00 $292.50 $1,020.00 $586.25 $572.00 NONE 1450.4 (24) $14.99

18.25 BRAND 
NAME: 

HELENA 25-0-
11 19.75 19-0-6 $50.00 NONE No Bid

Crop production Services, 
20 Liberty Way, Suite D, 

Franklin MA 02038 400 (28) NO BID 3000 (29) 203.75 (30) 798.00 (31) 235 (32) 368 (33) NONE $1,450.40 15.40 7-0-0 No Bid 17.35 19-0-6 No Bid NONE No Bid

Pro Lawn Supply Inc., 70 
Fremont st, Worcester MA 

01603 337 (11) No Bid No Bid $182.00 NO BID 211 (12) 323 (13) NONE NO BID $16.75 No Bid 18.50 (1) No Bid NONE No Bid
Winfield Solutions, 1811 

South County Rd, 
Osterville MA 02655 No Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $292.50 $1,020.00 $588.20

4 5LB CASES 
490.32 NONE $1,450.40 $16.00

40.20 BRAND: 
NUTRITE NO BID No Bid NONE No Bid

1. 18.0.5 LEBANON 5. MEFENOXAM

9. LEBANON 
PRO 24-0-10 

10% LSN
13.  FOSAL 

SELECT

17. 
MEFENOXA

M

21. LEBANON 
18.0.5 .09% 
DIMENSION 
25% MESA

25.BATTLESHIP 
3RD

29. 
BAYLETON 
FLOWABLE 

2X2.5
33. FOSETY 
1 A 1 4X5.5

37.  
MEFENOXAM 

2AQ

41. 
PROSECU
TOR PRO 

2.5

2. 9-19-19 30%XCU 6. IPRODIONE PRO

10. LEBANON 
22-0-6 40% 

SCU .86 TEAM
14. 22.0.6 TEAM 

LEBANON

18. 
IPRODIONE 

PRO

22. NUTRITE 
19.0.6 30% 
XCU .10% 

DIMENSION
26. GLYSTAR 

PLUS
30. ENSIGN 

720 2X2.5

34. 
KLEENUP 

PRO 2X2.5
38. 18 PLUS 

LESCO 2.5

42. 
ELIMINATE 

D 2.5

3. AQUATROLS 1690          
(5 GAL) 7. FOSETYL A1 11. TURF WET 15. CONDUIT 90

19. FOSETYL-
AL

23. SOAKER 
PLUS 27. TRIMEC 992

31. 
MEFENOXAM 

2X1

35 TRIMEC 
BENTGRASS 

2X2.5
39. FOSETYL 

A1 5.5

43. LESCO 
DIMENSIO
N .10% 19-

0-0 30% 
POLYPLU

S 50#

4. CHLORO 720

8. LEBANON PRO 
24-0-10 40% SCU 

2% FE
12.  IPRODINE 

2SE SELECT

16. 
CHLOROTHALONI

L 720 20. NUTRITE 24. AGENCY
28. LT 120 2X2.5 

GAL
32. CHIPIO 

26019 2X2.5
36. 19-0-6 

25X10

40 COUNTRY 
CLUB MD 18-

0-18E
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16. Links Sunny 
Mix 50 # bag

17.Turflinks (21-3-
21) 250 bags

18. Turflinks 
(28-5-12) 120 

bags

19. Turflinks 
(17-17-17) 40, 

50 bags
20. Milorganite 

20 bags

21. 
Millennium 

Ultra Plus 10 
gals (2/2.5 

gal) per case 

22. Razor 10 
gals  (2/2.5 gal) 
per case price

23. Triplet 
Sensitive 
10 gals  

(2/2.5 gal) 
per case 

24. Fertilizer  20-
3-4 110 bags

25. Dylox 6.2 
50 bags

$101.50/bag  
Brand:Allens Seed

21.12/BAG 
X250=5280.00 (8)

18.83/BAG X 
120=2259.60 

(9) No bid
11.25/BAG X20 = 

225.00
350/CASE 

X2 = 700.00
89.98/CASE X2= 

179.96 No Bid

22.65/BAG X 
110=2491.50 

(10)

136.12/BAG X 
50= 1806.00 

(11)

81.00 
Brand:LESCO

15.50 /bag 
Brand:Lesco 18-0-

12

15.50/bag 
Brand:Lesco 

24-0-4

17.07 
Brand:Lesco 

19-19-19 No Bid 485.9400 88 (41) 128 (42) 15.25 (43) 33.00

$70/bag 
Brand:Valley 

Green

$16.25 
Brand:Nutrite 21-0-

21

17.25 
Brand:TURF 

CARE 
SUPPLY 28-0-
12 3% IRON

16.50/bag 
$680 

Brand:Nutrite No Bid 315 120 105 17 33.5

92.50/bag 
Brand:JERSEYITE

18.25 
Brand:HELENA 

25-0-11
18.25/bag 

Helena 25-0-11

$19.25/bag 
Brand:19-19-
19  Helena

$11.75/bag $225 
Brand:Milorganite

$375/case 
(25) 83.75 (26) 132.5 (27) 21.50 22-0-6 36

88.50/bag brand: 
signature 

greenskeeper NO BID

15.75/bag 
brand: 

signature

19.85/bag 
brand: 

signature No Bid No Bid 105/case (34)
193/case 

(35) 17.35/bag (36) 36.60/bag

$75/bag 
Brand:Pro Lawn

$22/bag  
Brand:Reed & 

Perrone 

19.50/bag 
Brand:REED 

AND 
PERRONE No bid No Bid No Bid

$90/case  
Brand:Glyphosic 

41% No Bid

21.00/bag 
Brand:LEBANO

N (14) no bid

No Bid NO BID NO BID 20.00 (2) No Bid 320.68 NO BID 135 No Bid 34.95
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