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Chemical Fertilizers 2014

1. LescoFlo 15 
gallons

2. Rubigan A.S. 
8 gallons 

3. Bayleton 
50 NONE 
NEEDED 

THIS YEAR

4. Daconil 
Weather 

/Manicure 
Flow 15 

cases
5. Subdue 

Maxx 3 cases
6. Chipco GT 

15 cases

7. Aliette or 
Prodigy D.G. 

10 cases

8.Flowable 
Mancozeb 

NONE 
NEEDED 

THIS YEAR
9. Emerald 3 

case

10. Merit 
0.2 + 

fertilizer 
100 bags

11. Fertilizer 
26-3-13 200 

bags

12. 
Fertilizer 

18-5-9 
w/dimensio
n; 75 bags

13. Fertilizer 
18-3-18; 

100 bags

14.Fertilizer 
15-3-8;  
NONE 

NEEDED 
THIS YEAR

15. Top 
Dressing; 

30 tons
16. Links Sunny 

Mix 50 # bag
VENDOR

EH Turf Supply, Inc., 
DBA Allens Seed, 693 

South County Trail, 
Exeter RI 02822 $318/case  (1) $408/gallon   NONE

$137.50/case  
$2062.50  (3)

$793/case  
$2379  (4)

$237.50/case    
$3562.50 (5)

$400/case  
$4000  (6) NONE

$1450.40/case  
$4351.20

$17.64/bag  
$1764 No Bid No Bid

$50/bag  
$5000 NONE No Bid

$113.50/bag  
Brand:Allens Seed

John Deere 
Landscapes, 1385 E. 

36th Street, Cleveland 
OH 44114 $226/case  319.75/case NONE

$137.50/case  
$2062.50 

$718.86/case  
$2156.58  (4)

$184/case  
$2760 (10)

$313.88 
$3138 (6) NONE

$1450.40 
$14504 (11)

$14.50 
1450 No Bid No Bid No Bid NONE No Bid

$85.10/bag 
Brand:Sun & 

Shade Park Mix

Valley Green Inc., 642 
South Summer Street, 

Holyoke MA 01040 $210/case  (23) $325/gallon NONE
$125/case 
$1875 (3)

$675/case 
$2025 (4)

$212/case 
$3180

$330/case 
$3300 (6) NONE

$1310/case 
$3930

$13.50/bag  
$1350

$36/bag 
$7200 (24)

$16/bag 
$1200 (25)

$50/bag 
$5000 NONE No Bid

$82.50/bag 
Brand:Valley 

Green

Helena Chemical 
Company, 101 Elm 
Street, Hatfield MA 

01038 $225/case (15) $320/case NONE
$290/case 

$4350
$1020/case 

$3060
$666.20/case 

$9993
$594/case 

$5940 NONE
$1450.40/case 

$4351.20
$15.05/bag 

$1505
$17.79/bag 
$3558 (16)

$17.79/ba
g 

$1334.25 
(17)

$50/bag 
$5000 NONE No Bid

$85/bag 
Brand:Links 
Sunny Mix

Agrium Direct Solutions, 
80 Mousehorn Rd, East 

Greenwich RI 02818
$415.25/case 

(26) $300/gallon NONE
$290/case 

$4350
$1020/case 

$3060
$602.35/case 

$9035.25
$514.14/case 

$5141.40 NONE
$1401.40/case 

$4204.20
$16.90/bag 

$1690 No Bid

$18.65/ba
g 

$1398.75 
(12) No Bid NONE No Bid No Bid

Pro Lawn Supply Inc., 
67A Millbrook St, 

Worcester MA 01606 No Bid No Bid NONE
$138/case 
$2070 (3)

$657/case 
$1971(20)

$212/case 
$3180 (5)

$304.04/case 
$3040.40 (21) NONE

$1450/case 
$4350

$16.30/bag  
$1630 No Bid

$16.75 
$1256.25  

(22)
$36.25/bag 

$3625 NONE No Bid
$81.50/bag 

Brand:Pro Lawn

Winfield Solutions, 1811 
South County Rd, 

Osterville MA 02655 No Bid $314.75/gallon NONE
$290/case 

$4350
$1020/case 

$3060
$576.65/case 

$8649.75

$474.80/case 
(20lb case) 

$2848.80 NONE
$1401.40/case 

$4204.20
$20.50/bag 

$2050

$42.50/bag 
$8500 

Brand:Winfield

$27.50/ba
g 

$2062.50 No Bid NONE No Bid
$100/bag 

Brand:Winfield

Green Resource LLC, 
191 Bydd Blvd, Winston-

Salem NC 27103
$411.50/case 

(30) No Bid NONE
$178.80/cass

e $2682 (3)
$785.70/case 
$2357.10 (4)

$309.50/case 
$4642.50 (5)

$421.60/case 
$4216 (6) NONE

$1401.40/case 
$4204.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NONE No Bid No Bid

1-Sixteen 90

4.-Subs. 
Mefenoxam 2 

AQ Fungicide 1 
gl

7. -Subs. 
Glyphosel Pro

10.- Sub. 
Lesco 18 

Plus
13.- Sub. 

Prosector Pro

16.- Sub. 25-5-
11 50% 

PCSCU 2 % 
Fe 220 SGN

19.- Sub. 
EndRun

22.- Sub. 17-0-
2 .10 Dithoper 

Nutrile

25.- Sub. 18-
0-5 .09% 

Dimension 
25% MESA 

SGN 200

28.- Sub. 
Kleenup Pro 

2x2.5 gal

31.- Sub. 
Glyphosote 

Plus

2. Sub 28-3-8

5.-Subs. 
Iprodione Pro 

2SE 2.5 gl
8.- Subs. 

Trimec Bent
11.- Sub. 

Agency
14.- Sub. 

Eliminate-D

17.- Sub. 19-0-
6 40% 

PCSCU .10% 
Dimension

20.- Sub. 
Regulate 

Select
23.- Sub. 

Condvit 90

26.- Sub. 
LT120 2x2.5 

Gal

29.- Sub. 
Trimec 

Bentgrass 
2x2.5 gal

3.-Subs. Chlorothalanil 
720 2.5 gl

6.-Subs. Quali-
Pro Fosetyl-A1 

5.5 lb 
(4x5.5/cs)

9.- Subs. 22-0-
6

12.- Sub. 
Momentum 

Q
15.- Sub. 

Soaker Plus

18.- Sub. 
RoundUp 

Custom 54% 
Al

21.- Sub. 
Fosal Select 

4x5.5
24.- Sub. 

Nutrite

27.- Sub. 19-
0-6 25% xco 

.1% 
dimension 

30.- Sub. 
Magnus
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17.Turflinks (21-3-
21) 250 bags

18. Turflinks 
(28-5-12) 120 

bags

19. Turflinks 
(17-17-17) 40 

bags
20. Milorganite 

20 bags

21. 
Millennium 

Ultra Plus 10 
gals (2/2.5 

gal) per case 

22. Razor 10 
gals  (2/2.5 gal) 
per case price

23. Triplet 
Sensitive 
10 gals  

(2/2.5 gal) 
per case 

24. Fertilizer  
20-3-4 110 

bags
25. Dylox 6.2 

50 bags

$26/bag $6500 
Brand:Allens 

Seed

$25/bag  
$3000  

Brand:Allens 
Seed  (2) No bid

$14.60/bag  $292  
Brand:Milorganite

$352/case  
$704

$98/case  $196  
(7)

$248/case  
$496  (8)

$21.33/bag  
$2346.30 

Brand:Lebano
n (9)

$38.69/bag  
$1934.50

$21.22/bag 
Brand:Lesco 21-0-

21

$17/63/bag 
Brand:Lesco 

25-0-6

$16.11 
Brand:Lesco 

19-19-19 No Bid
$450/case  
$900 (12)

$100/case $1000 
(13)

$128/case 
$1280 (14) No Bid $33/bag $1650

$19/bag $4750 
Brand:Nutrite 21-0-

21

$19/bag $4750 
Brand:TCS 

Growth Star 28-
0-12 35% Slow 

1% Fe

$17/bag $680 
Brand:Nutrite 

19-19-19
$14/bag $280 

Brand:Milorganite
$165/case 

$330 $110/case $220
$105/case 

$210

$14/bag 
$1540 Brand 
19-0-0 .10% 
Dimension 
30% SCU $32/bag $1600

$17.79/bag 
$447.50 Brand:25-
5-11 50% PCSCU 
2% Fe 220 SGN

$25.25/bag 
$3030 

Brand:25-0-8 
25% PCSCU 
120 SGN 50 
lbs (Helena)

$19.25/bag 
$770 

Brand:19-19-
19 (50 lbs) 

Helena
$11.25/bag $225 
Brand:Milorganite

$322/case 
$644

$112.50/case 
$225 (18)

$175/case 
$350 (19)

$21.25/bag 
$2337.50 

Brand:22-0-6 
40% Scu 

.86% Team 
50lbs) 

Lebanon $33/bag $1650

$22.50/bag $5625 
Brand:21-3-21 

75xcu

$17.50/bag 
$2100 

Brand:24-0-5 
40%xcu 2% Fe No bid No Bid No Bid

$110/case $220 
(28)

$195/case 
$390 (29)

$18.65/bag 
$2051.50 (27)

$35.90/bag 
$1795

$17.55/bag  
$4387.50 

Brand:Nutrile 21-0-
21 50% xcu 1%Fe

$15.70/bag 
$1884 

Brand:Nutrile 
24-0-5 40%xcu 

2%Fe

$18.50/bag  
$740 

Brand:couldn't 
read No Bid No Bid

$90/case $180 
Brand:Glystar 

Por No Bid

$16.90/bag 
$1859 

Brand:Nurtile 
17-0-2 .10 
Dithopyr 
25%xcu 36.00

$30.65/bag 
$7662.50 

Brand:Winfield 21-
0-21

$25.75/bag 
$3090 

Brand:Winfield 
26-0-10

$27.50/bag 
$1100 

Brand:Winfiel
d 19-19-19 No Bid

$315.70/case 
$631.40 

$99.75/case 
$199.50

$135/case 
$270 No Bid

$32.70/bag 
$1635

$19.85/bag 
$4962.50 

Brand:Spring 
Valley

$19.40/bag 
$2328 

Brand:Spring 
Valley No Bid No Bid

$372.50/case 
$745

$115/case $230 
(31) No Bid No Bid

$37.60/bag 
$1880
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