
Contract Cleaning - Public Restroom & Facilities
Bid Opened 10:00 a.m. January 6, 2015

Jani-King of RI, 
969 Waterman 
Ave, E Prov, 
02914

Azade Perin-
Monteroso, dba 
Sergio's Services, 
44 Rankin Ave, 
Providence 02908

Crandall 
Associates, 35 

Elmwood Dr, NK 
02852

S.J. Services, 
Inc., 235 

Newbury St, 
Danvers, MA  

01923
Bid Option:
Option I
A.) WP, McGinn & RP No Bid 11,448.00$             7,844.00$          No Bid
Per Day:
WP 27.00$                     15.00$               
McGinn 15.00$                     12.00$               
Ryan Park 12.00$                     10.00$               
B.) Signal Rock No Bid 3,515.00$                1,850.00$          No Bid
Per Day: 19.00$                     10.00$               

Option I Total: 14,963.00$             9,694.00$          

Option ll - Town Beach No Bid 4,140.00$               2,760.00$          No Bid
Per Day: 45.00$                     30.00$               

Option III - GC Clubhouse 2,638.00$            1,395.00$               930.00$             No Bid
Per Day: 85.10$                  45.00$                     30.00$               

Option IV (Bid Town Beach)
A. Transfer Station  $            3,390.00 1,300.00$                988.00$             No Bid
Per Day: 40.85$                  25.00$                     19.00$               
B. Wickford Rest Rooms 2,820.00$            2,185.00$                1,725.00$          No Bid
Per Day: 17.16$                  19.00$                     15.00$               

Option IV Total: 6,210.00$            3,485.00$               2,713.00$          No Bid

Option V - Com Center 6,659.00$            1,560.00$               3,640.00$          No Bid
Per Day: 95.37$                  30.00$                     70.00$               

Option VI - Highway 
Garage 15,000.00$          No Bid 15,240.00$       No Bid
(a.) per day: 57.69$                  30.00$               
(b.) per day: 60.00$               
(c.) per day: 30.00$               

Option VII - All Tasks 
Options I-VI 30,000.00$          * No Bid 34,977.00$       59,638.00$    

*Flat rate only for 
items bid on

(Discount 
$3/$100 in 15 
days)
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