ANALYSIS SHEET FOR COMPARISON ONLY - MISC ROAD CONST MATERIALS OPENED 3/18/2016

H.C. Cardi Dry Bridge Narra. Material PJ
Trucking, | Corporatio Cherenzia Sand & Stone, |Improvemen| Johnston T Miozzi EJ. Sand and Keating
Inc. n Excavation Inc. t Asphalt Inc. JHLynch | Prescott | Stone Corp | Company
Location: Lafayette Rd| Lincoln Ave |Old Hopkinton Rd Dry Bridge Rd | Allens Ave |Allendale Ave Airport Rd| North Rd |Albion Rd|Greenville RdPhenix Avd
NK Warwick Westerly NK Providence | Johnston | Coventry |[Peace Dale| Lincoln | N Smithfield| Cranston
1|Process Gravel /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton
a. picked up No Bid $13.50 $10.50 $10.00 $18.00 No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid $9.25 $10.50
b. delivered No Bid $17.50 $18.00 $12.85 No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid $14.45 $15.70
2|Cru. stone/gravel /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton
a. picked up No Bid $16.50 $18.50 $13.50 $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 $12.50
b. delivered No Bid $20.50 $26.00 $16.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $17.70
3|Brick Sand /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton [ton /ton /ton [ton [ton [ton
a. picked up No Bid $16.50 $37.00 $19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.95 $21.00
b.delivered No Bid $20.50 $44.50 $21.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $26.20
4|Winter Sand /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton [ton /ton /ton [ton [ton [ton
a. picked up $10.60 $13.50 $12.50 $12.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 $9.75
b.delivered $14.85 $17.50 $20.00 $15.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 $14.95
5/Port/Mason.Cem
A.Portland a. pick up-Pallet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $503.60 No Bid No Bid
b.deliver-Pallet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $503.60 No Bid No Bid
a. pick up/Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.59 No Bid No Bid
b.deliver/Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.59 No Bid No Bid
B.Masonry a. pick up-Pallet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $264.18 No Bid No Bid
b.deliver-Pallet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $264.18 No Bid No Bid
a. pick up/Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.29 No Bid No Bid
b.deliver/Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.29 No Bid No Bid
6|Concrete Mater. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y. c.y.
a.Port.Ce lcy. No Bid $335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $330.00 No Bid
2cy. No Bid $230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $216.00 No Bid
3cy. No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $177.00 No Bid
4 c.y. No Bid $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $157.00 No Bid
5c.y. No Bid $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 No Bid
6 plus c.y. No Bid $123.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.00 No Bid
6b Flowable Concrete, flow c.y. cy. c.y. cy. cy. cy. cy. c.y. c.y. c.y.
lcy. No Bid $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $273.00 -
2cy. No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid
3cy. No Bid $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00 No Bid
4 c.y. No Bid $115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $119.00 No Bid
5c.y. No Bid $98.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103.00 No Bid
6 plus c.y. No Bid $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid




ANALYSIS SHEET FOR COMPARISON ONLY - MISC ROAD CONST MATERIALS OPENED 3/18/2016

H.C. Cardi Dry Bridge Narra. Material PJ
Trucking, | Corporatio Cherenzia Sand & Stone, |Improvemen| Johnston T Miozzi EJ. Sand and Keating
Inc. n Excavation Inc. t Asphalt Inc. JHLynch | Prescott | Stone Corp | Company
7|Precast Conc.Blks each each each each each each each each each each each
1. picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2. delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8|Loam /ton /ton /ton [ton' /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton
A. Screened a. picked up $13.75 No Bid No Bid $15.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid
b. delivered $15.00 No Bid No Bid $18.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid
B. Unscreened
a. picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b. delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9| Infield Mix /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton [ton /ton /ton [ton [ton [ton
a. picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 $19.50
b. delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $24.70
10 |Bitumin.Concrete /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton [ton /ton /ton? [ton [ton [ton
A.(Class I-1) a. picked up No Bid $67.95 No Bid No Bid $68.00 No Bid $62.00 $68.00 No Bid No Bid $68.00
b. delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $77.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
B. (Class I-2) a. picked up No Bid $67.95 No Bid No Bid $68.00 No Bid $62.00 $68.00 No Bid No Bid $68.00
b. delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $77.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
C. (ColdPatch) |a. picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
b. delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $121.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Plant Location Warwick Providence Coventry |Peace Dale Cranston
11|UPM/High Perf. Perm| /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton [ton [ton [ton
1. Picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00
2. Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.20
12 |Stone Riprap /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton /ton [ton [ton [ton
a. picked up No Bid $26.00 $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.50 $21.00
b. delivered No Bid $30.00 $30.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.00 $26.20
Early Pay Discount: 2% 10 days
A#10 A&B: I-1 & 12 available Apr. - Nov.; minimum 23 tons delivered
#10 C - when product is available; minimum 15 tons delivered




MISC ROAD-CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - OPENED 3/18/2016
ANALYSIS SHEET FOR COMPARISON PURPOSES ONLY

ITEM 13. Pipe, Spiral Aluminum

Warwick EJ
Winwater Prescott
A. (Solid)
/ft /ft
6 Inch a. picked up No Bid $5.86
b. delivered No Bid $5.86
8 Inch a. picked up No Bid $7.70
b. delivered No Bid $7.70
12 Inch a. picked up No Bid $11.67
b. delivered No Bid $11.67
15 Inch a. picked up No Bid $14.59
b.delivered No Bid $14.59
18 Inch a. picked up No Bid $17.51
b.delivered No Bid $17.51
24 Inch a. picked up No Bid $22.98
b.delivered No Bid $22.98
B. (Perforated)
/ft /ft
6 Inch a. picked up No Bid $6.15
b. delivered No Bid $6.15
8 Inch a. picked up No Bid $8.09
b. delivered No Bid $8.09
12 Inch a. picked up No Bid $12.25
b. delivered No Bid $12.25
15 Inch a. picked up No Bid $15.32
b.delivered No Bid $15.32
18 Inch a. picked up No Bid $18.38
b.delivered No Bid $18.38
24 Inch a. picked up No Bid $24.12

b.delivered No Bid $24.12



MISC ROAD-CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - OPENED 3/18/2016

ITEM 14. PIPE, (HDPE), CORRUGATED, SMOOTH CORE

A. (Solid)

12 Inch

15 Inch

18 Inch

24 Inch

30 Inch

36 Inch

a. picked up

b. delivered

a. picked up

b. delivered

a. picked up

b. delivered

a. picked up

b.delivered

a. picked up

b.delivered

a. picked up

b.delivered

E.J. Prescott
/ft.

$5.61
$5.61

$7.22
$7.22

$10.82
$10.82

$16.34
$16.34

$26.21
$26.21

$32.57
$32.57

Warwick
WinWater Works
Co.

/ft.

$5.35
$5.35

$6.88
$6.88

$10.32
$10.32

$15.57
$15.57

$24.98
$24.98

$31.00
$31.00

Scituate
Concrete
Products

/ft.

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

EJ USA,
Inc.

/ft.

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

B. (Perforated)

12 Inch

15 Inch

18 Inch

24 Inch

30 Inch

36 Inch

a. picked up
b. delivered

a. picked up

b. delivered

a. picked up
b. delivered

a. picked up

b.delivered

a. picked up
b.delivered

a. picked up

b.delivered

ITEM 15. SQUARE FRAME AND GRATE * Bid did not specify 3-sided or 4-sided flange/EJ Prescott did not separte by 3 or 4 sides.

(Regular) ea.
3-sided Flange

4-sided Flange

(Bicycle Safe) ea.

3-sided Flange

4-sided Flange

a. picked up
b.delivered
a. picked up
b.delivered

a. picked up
b.delivered
a. picked up
b.delivered

344.44%
344.44%

360.09*
360.09*

$377.60
$377.60
$390.75
$390.75

$381.27
$381.27
$394.41
$394.41

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$366.81
$366.81
$379.58
$379.58

$370.37
$370.37
$383.14
$383.14

E.). Prescott
/ft.

$5.61
$5.61

$7.22
$7.22

$10.82
$10.82

$16.34
$16.34

$26.21
$26.21

$32.57
$32.57

Warwick
WinWater
Works Co.

/ft.

$5.35
$5.35

$6.88
$6.88

$10.32
$10.32

$15.57
$15.57

$24.98
$24.98

$31.00
$31.00

Scituate
Concrete
Products

/ft.

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

EJ USA, Inc.
/ft.

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid



Warwick Scituate

Warwick Scituate
WinWater Works Concrete EJ USA, WinWater Concrete
E.J. Prescott Co. Products Inc. E.J. Prescott Works Co. Products EJ USA, Inc.

ITEM 16. SPUNBOUND NONWOVEN FILTER FABRIC @ minimum 120 mils, 12.5' wide rolls, 400' long
a. picked up No Bid $0.58 sy/400' roll No Bid No Bid
b.delivered No Bid $0.58 sy/400'roll No Bid No Bid

ITEM 17. PRECAST SUMP FOR ROUND CATCH BASINS

a. picked up No Bid No Bid $ 295.00 NoBid
b.delivered No Bid No Bid $ 340.00 NoBid
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