1. LexcoFlo 25 Gals.

Helena Chemical Company - 101 EIm Sub - Soaker Plus

St. Hartfield, MA 01038

Pro Lawn Supply - 70 Fremont St.
Worcester, MA 01603

Atlantic Golf & Turf - 9 Industrial Blvd.

Turners Falls, MA 01376

Central Turf & Irrigation Supply - 129
Chestnut St. Warwick, Rl 02888

EH Turf Supply - 693 South County
Trail Exeter, R1 02822

Winfield - 1811 South County Rd.
Osterville, MA 02655

Site One Landscape Supply - 1385 East

36th St. Cleveland, OH 44114

180.00/ Case

No Bid

No Bid

279.05/ Case

331.25/ Case

No Bid

247.82/ Case

2. Xemplar (2
cases)

3296.88/ Case
(Agency)

No Bid

6593.76/ Total

No Bid

3296.88/ Case

3296.88/ Case

3296.88/ Case

3. Bayleton50
(case)

2700.00/ Case
(Agency)

No Bid

No Bid

3253.00/ Case

No Bid

2700.00/ Case

2700.00/ Case



4. Daconil Weather Stick
or Manicure Flow 6; 15
cases

Daconil - 305.00/Case
Generic - 162.50/Case

Chlorathalonl- 175.00/
Case

No Bid

187.12/ Case

Chlorothalonil 720 -
198.38/ Case

305.00/ Case

Manicure - 179.56/ Case

5. Subdue Maxx 12 Cases
2X1gal.

Subdue - 1030.00/Case
Generic - 696.50/Case

No Bid

No Bid

802.00/ Case

Regulate - 699.00/Case

1030.00/ Case

756.00/ Case

6. Chipco GT 30 Cases 2 X 2
1/2 gal.

Chipco GT -586.25 Chipco
26019 - 325.00 Generic
Iprodione - 195.00

Iprodione Pro - 195.00/ Case

867.52/ Total

199.90/ Case

Iprodione Pro 2SE - 235.00/
Case

588.25/ Case

18 Plus Lesco - 201.94/ Case



7. Aliette or Prodigy D.G. 10. Merit 0.2 Plus Fert.
20 Cases (1 case=2X 11 9. Emerald 3 0-0-7 75 Bags 50lb  11. Fertilizer 26-3-13
Ibs.) Cases 10 X.49lbs Bags 150 bags

Chipco Signature - 572.00
Generic Fosetyl-Al - 308.00

Signature Xtra- 625.00 1479.80/ Case 13.25/ Bag No Bid
Fosal Select - 317.00/ Case No Bid 16.00/ Bag No Bid
Sub 24-0-12 -
No Bid 4439.40/ Total 17.57/ Bag 41.50/Bag
No Bid 1479.80/ Case 16.93/ Bag No Bid
Fosetyl Al - 377.00/ Case 1479.80/ Case No Bid No bid
495.80/ Case 1479.80/ Case 18.00/ Bag 42.50/ Bag

327.80/ Case 1479.80/ Case 16.50/ Bag No Bid



12. Fertilizer (18-5-9) 13. Fertilizer 18-0- 16. Link Sunny Mix 50 Ib
W/ Dimension (.09%) 18 70 Bags 40 Ib. 14. Fertilizer 15. Top Dressing Bags Approx. 600-800
150 bags 501b bags Bags 15-3-8 30 Tons Ibx)

Blue/Rye/Fine - 84.55/
15.90/ Bag 50.00/ Bag Bag

18-0-5 W/ Dion .09 % -
18.50/ Bag No Bid

Sub 18-0-3 W/ .17%

Dimension - 19.00/Bag 51.00/ Bag 70.00/ Bag

No Bid 50.00/ Bag No Bid
No Bid 50.00/ Bag Allen's Seed 120.00/ Bag
No Bid No Bid No Bid

50.00/ Bag 82.00/ Bag




19. TurfLinks 17- 20. Milorganite 6-2-
17. TurfLinks 21-3-21 18. TurflLinks 28-5- 17-17 40, 50lb 0w/ 4% Iron 20, 21. Millennium
250, 501b Bags 12 120, 501lb Bags Bags 50lb Bags Ultra Plus 10 Gal.

Helena Promate ProMate 19-19-19
21-0-21 50% XCU - 25-0-550% XCU - 220 SGN - 16.00/ Milorganite - 11.00/ Battleship -
14.50/Bag 14.75/ Bag Bag Bag 300.00/ Case

Reed & Perre 19-
Reed & Perre - 20.25/ Reed& Perre - 19-19 SGN 200 -

Bag 15.75/ Bag 17.00/ Bag No Bid No Bid
Sub Turf Care 20-0-10 - Sub Lebanon 16-
20.00/ Bag 25.00/ Bag 25-12 - 25.00/ Bag 15.00/ Bag 375.00/ Case

NuFarm - 345.06/
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Case

Milorganite - 12.85/ NuFarm - 320.00/
No Bid No Bid No Bid Bag Case

No Bid No Bid 21.50/ Bag No Bid 334.10/ Case

Momentum FX2-
16.50/ Bag 14.59/ Bag 16.57/ Bag No Bid 295.40/ Bag



24. Fertilizer 20-3-4

22, Razor - Approx 23. Triplet 25% SCU .86% Team -  25. Dylox 6.2
10 Gal. Sensitive - 10 Gal. 110, 50lb Bags (Grub Control) DELIVERY

Trimec Bentgrass -
182.50 / Case

Any Avail Generic - Trimec 992 -
83.75/ Case 125.00/ Case No Bid 33.00/ Bag of PO

Bayer Dylox -  Within 10 days

Bayer - 41.00/
Glystar- 85.00/ Bag No Bid Lebanon - 21.50/ Bag Bag 3-5 Days

Sub Lebanon 22-0-6
.86% Team - 25.00/

105.00/ Case 150.00/ Case Bag 37.00/ Bag ASAP
NuFarm-104.76/  NuFarm- 150.00/
Case Case No Bid 45.26/ Bag As Needed
Gly Pho-Sel Pro 41% -  Triad 3-Way - Lebanon 22-0-6 w/ Dylox-36.00/ 2 Weeks ARO
89.00/ Case 135.00/ Case Team - 21.00/ Bag Bag or Sooner
Winfield
Cornerstone Plus -  Triplet SF 140.00/
61.58/ Case Case No Bid 37.50/ Bag As Requested
Lesco Prosecutor -  Lesco Eliminate - Lesco Dimension - Bayer-Dylox -

97.58/ Bag 149.62/ Case 19.84/ Bag 45.00/Bag  2-7 Days ARO



WARRANTEE/
EARLY PAYMENT GUARANTEE

Only Manufacturers

2% net 15 Warrantees Apply
None Per Mfg.
Less 2% Net 15 Yes
Manufacturer
2% Net 10 Warantee/Guarantee
None N/A
N/A As Per Manufacturer

N/A Manufacturer Warrantee



