

	WinField	SiteOne
LescoFlo 4 Cases 25/ Gal per case	No Bid	251.50/ Case
Xzemplar 2 Cases	3,429.12/ Case	3,429.12/ Case
Bayleton50 1 Case	2,700.00/ Case	2,700.00/ Case
Daconil Weather Stick or Manicure Flow 6 25 Cases; case= 5 gal (2x2.5)	Daconil 305.00/ Case	Manicure flow 186.26/ Case
Subdue Maxx 8 Cases	1,030.00/Case	Mefenfenoxam 2 AQ 742.62/ Case
Chipco GT 15 Cases	588.20/ Case	18 Plus 197.90/ Case
Aliette 16 Cases	613.80/ Case	Fosetyl-AL 334.44/ Case
Emerald 2 Cases	1,524.30/ Case	1524.29/ Case
Merit .02 Plus Fertilizer 0-0-7 80 Bags / 50lb per bag	17.20/ Bag	13.50/ bag
Fertilizer 26-3-13 250 Bags	42.50/ Bag	No Bid
Fertilizer 18-5-9 w/Dimension 150 Bags	No Bid	Lesco Dimension 14.95/ Bag
Fertilizer 18-0-18 80 Bags	No Bid	Country Club MD 40/Bag
Top Dressing 30 Tons	No Bid	No Bid
URI Contractors Blend 50lb Bag	No Bid	Premium Hydro Seed Mix 68/ Bag
Turflinks (21-3-21) 250, 50lb Bags	No Bid	Lesco 14.50/ Bags
Turflinks (17-17-17) 40, 50lb Bags	Nutrite 16.87/Bag	Lesco 16/ Bag
Milorganite (6-2-0 w. 4% iron) 20, 50lb Bags	No Bid	No Bid
Triplet Sensitive 10 Gals. 2/2.5 gal.	134.45/ Case	Three -Way Selective 125.90/ Case
Fertilizer 20-3-4 25%SCU .86 Team	No Bid	Lesco Dimension 19.57/ Bag
Dylox 6.2 approx. 50, 30lb bags	39.30/ Bag	45/Bag