
RECREATION ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT BID Advertised:1/14/2016

Emailed: 1/14/2016

Opened: 2/1/2016 at 11:00 AM 

Athletic Equipment Bid 1/28/2014

Tee Shirts Tee Shirts

Softball 

Sliders

Softball 

Visors

Softball 

Helmets

Softball 

Bags

Basketball 

Bags Shipping

Option 1 Option 2

Elmwood Sports Center - 

1533 Elmwood Ave. 

Cranston, RI 02910 8.94/each 7.94/each

Brand: Mizuno 

18.94/pair 

227.28/dozen 6.44/each 40.94/each

Brand: 

Martin 

36.94/each 31.94/each

no additional 

charge specified

Home Team Athletics - 242 

S Wilmington Hwy 

Jacksonville, NC 28540 7.98/each 6.48/each

Brand: 

Champro 

16.25/pair 

195.00/dozen 7.30/each 43.00/each

Brand: 

Allcasion 

24.90/each

Brand: Allcasion 

18.75/each 

no additional 

charge specified

Impressive Promo Products 

- 645 N Rochester Rd. 

Clawson, MI 48017

6.95/each (S-

XL) 

8.95/each 

(2X-3X)

5.50/each (S-

XL)   

7.50/each (2X-

3X) NO BID 5.95/each NO BID NO BID NO BID 

no additional 

charge specified

Lids - 85 Katrine Ln Lake 

Katrine, NY 12449 NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.90/each 36.45/each NO BID NO BID

no additional 

charge specified

Express Press - 1860 E St. 

Louis St. Springfield, MO 

65802 6.48/each 4.93/each NO BID 4.85/each NO BID NO BID NO BID

no additional 

charge specified

Cool Air Creations - 10 

Business Park Dr. 

Smithfield, RI 02917 12.99/each 8.99/each

Brand: Venus 

Womens     

7.99/ each 4.99/ each 44.99/ each 

Brand: 

Venus 

24.99/each 23.50/each

no additional 

charge specified

Riddell/Easton Bell Sports - 

669 Sugar Lane Elyria, OH 

44035 9.60/each 7.35/each

Brand: 

Shockdoctor 

258 

247.20/dozen 

20.60/each 10.50/ each NO BID NO BID NO BID 

3% of total order 

shipping charge

BSN Sports - 1091 Mohawk 

Rd. Niskayuna, NY 12309 11.75/ each 9.75/ each

Brand: 

Champro 

117.00/ dozen 

9.75/ each 

Brand: Sport 

Tek             

10.00/ each

Brand: 

Rawlings 

480.00/dozen 

40.00/each NO BID NO BID

no additional 

charge specified

Eastbay, Inc - 111 South 

1st Ave. Wausau, WI 

54401 NO BID NO BID 

Brand: Wilson 

Torq 

29.42/each 8.32/each 38.86/each NO BID NO BID 

no additional 

charge specified


