
Contract Cleaning - Public Restroom & Facilities
Bid Opened 10:00 a.m. December 31, 2015 @ 10:00 a.m.

Jani-King of RI, 

969 Waterman 

Ave, E Prov, 

02914

Azade Perin-

Monteroso, dba 

Sergio's Services, 

44 Rankin Ave, 

Providence 02908

Crandall 

Associates, 35 

Elmwood Dr, NK 

02852

S.J. Services, 

Inc., 235 

Newbury St, 

Danvers, MA  

01923

Martins 

Maintenance 

Inc., 487 

Waterman 

Ave., East 

Providence, RI  
Bid Option:
Option I
A.) WP, McGinn & RP No Bid No Bid 8,284.00$          No Bid 6,891.00$         
Per Day:
WP 16.00$               14.99$              
McGinn 10.00$               8.31$                 
Ryan Park 12.00$               8.31$                 
B.) Signal Rock No Bid No Bid 3,294.00$          No Bid 1,928.82$         
Per Day: 18.00$               10.54$              

Option I Total:  11,578.00$       8,819.82$         

Option ll - Town Beach No Bid No Bid 2,200.00$          No Bid 2,045.00$         
Per Day: 25.00$               23.24$              

Option III - GC Clubhouse No Bid No Bid 899.00$             No Bid 2,584.00$         
Per Day: 29.00$               83.35$              

Option IV
A. Transfer Station  No Bid 1,300.00$               No Bid No Bid 2,078.00$         
Per Day:  25.00$                     39.96$              
B. Wickford Rest Rooms No Bid 2,320.00$               No Bid No Bid 2,037.00$         
Per Day: 20.00$                      17.56$              

Option IV Total: No Bid 3,620.00$                No Bid 4,115.00$         

Option V - Com Center No Bid 2,600.00$               No Bid No Bid 2,078.00$         
Per Day: 50.00$                      39.96$              

Option VI - Highway 

Garage 1,249.00$            * 15,222.00$             14,180.00$       No Bid 14,075.00$      
(b.) per day: 59.50$                     25.00$               19.75$              
(c.) per day: 29.50$                     40.00$               39.48$              

Option VII - All Tasks 

Options I-VI No Bid  No Bid 28,857.00$       ** 51,816.00$    31,927.00$      
*(monthly amt 

bid; 

annual14,988)

 (Discount: 3% if 

paid by10th day of 

mo.) 

**Price does 

not include IV & 

V)

(Discount 

$3/$100 in 15 

days)


